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excuse lack of preview pics but im a
learner. A post shared by molly

groove 2000 ( milly grove2000) on
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and Erica Groove 2000Â .RECORDING
MESSAGE: The International Space

Station (ISS) will be performing
routine maintenance in the Cupola
area on both of its solar arrays on 3
April 2019. The Cupola and Kibo will
undergo the maintenance between
08:00 and 18:30 local time (UTC).

This will include the replacement of
the single window in the Cupola. The
crew is already back inside the ISS

and Dragon will remain docked
during the time of maintenance.

There will be no effect to the main
Dragon’s mission. FLIGHT LEVEL
TASKS: Progress MS-11 will be

docked to the aft port of the ISS
between 07:30 and 19:45 UTC. There
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will be no activity in the Cupola
during the period of the Soyuz
TMA-17M mission. PVT (POS) of

Dragon can only be performed when
Dragon is docked. This will start on 3
April 2019 at 22:59 UTC. Dragon will

exit its berthing port and start its
approach to the ISS. In the

meantime, the crew will perform
regular checkout on the ISS. Image
Gallery SUBSCRIBE NEWSLETTER
COPYRIGHT The copyright for the
pictures and videos shown on this
website is owned by Spacefacts, in

accordance with the purposes of the
Copyright, designed and limited to

publication and dissemination
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